
ELECTORAL CALENDAR 

 

 

   
 

Electoral Process 

Days Date 

From 
Previou 

Step 

From 
Calling 

To the 
Elecctions 

 

1 Summons and publication of the General Assembly 
for the opening of the electoral procedure  
 
Summons and publication of the General Assembly 
for Election 

0 0 90 14 December 

2 Presentation of volunteers for the Electoral 
Commission 

25 25 65 8 January 

3 Extraordinary General Meeting for the opening of the 
electoral procedure and election of the Electoral 
Commission 

5 30 60 13 January 

4 Approval of the Electoral Roll by the Electoral 
Commission 

5 35 55 18 January 

5 Deadline for challenges to the Electoral Census 5 40 50 23 January 

6 Deadline for resolution of challenges by the Electoral 
Committee, approval and publication of the definitive 
Electoral Roll 

3 43 47 26 January 

7 Deadline for submission of applications 7 50 40 2 February 
8 Period for the verification of candidacies by the 

Electoral Commission, at the end of which the 
candidacies shall be provisionally proclaimed. 

3 53 37 5 February 

9 Deadline for challenges to nominations 5 58 32 10 February 

10 Deadline for the Electoral Commission to resolve 
challenges to candidacies 

3 61 29 13 February 

11 Proclamation and definitive publication of the 
admitted candidacies and their programs. 

0 61 29 13 February 

12 Deadline for admission and certification of 
attendance and telematic voting. 

- - 48 hours  
before  

12 March 

13 Extraordinary General Assembly for the voting of the 
Presidency and Board of Directors and provisional 
proclamation. 

29 90 0 14 March 

14 Deadline for challenges to the provisional result 10 100 +10 24 March 

15 Deadline for the resolution of challenges by the 
Electoral Commission and final proclamation of the 
candidacies by the Electoral Committee. 

5 105 +15 29 March 

16 Publication of the most voted candidacy on the 
Club's bulletin board and website. Communication to 
the Andalusian Golf Federation and the Andalusian 
Register of Sports Entities. 

    

 


